
 
 
 

   

LABOR DAY CAMP 

Monday, Sept. 1st 

8:00 a.m.–4:00 p.m. 
     School’s out for Labor Day 
but we will be open for our 
Labor Day Camp! Join us for 
a fun day of gymnastics, 
trampoline, art project, pizza 
lunch, games and so much 
more! What a fun way for your 
child to spend their day off of 
school. Camp is from 8:00 
a.m. – 4:00 p.m. Call or stop 
by today to reserve your spot! 
 

NO CLASSES  

LABOR DAY 
     Make up for Labor Day 
classes is Friday, September 
5th at your regular class time. 
 

HOW ARE WE DOING? 
     We need your help to 
make Bama Bounders the 
best it can be. We want to 
know what we are doing well 
and where we can improve. A 
bi-weekly survey will be 
emailed out to everyone. 
Please take a moment to fill it 
out and let us know what is 
good and bad at Bama 
Bounders! Thanks for your 
help!! 
 

PARENTS NIGHT OUT 

Friday, Sept. 12th  

“Fall & Football Fun”    

       Come join us for our 
September “Fall & Football 
Fun” Parents Night Out on 
Friday, September 12th. We 
will have gymnastics, games, 
contests, art projects, 
trampoline, a movie, pizza 
and so much more!  
     The cost of Parent’s Night 
Out is $20. The evening is 
from 6:00 – 10:00 p.m. All 
students and their friends are 
invited to attend. All 
participants must be potty 
trained! 
     Be sure to sign up at the 
front desk to reserve your 
spot today! 
Upcoming Dates are: 

Oct. 10th  
Nov. 7th  
Dec. 5th  
Jan. 16th  

 

PRESCHOOL 

PLAYTIME 
Tuesdays and Fridays 

10:00 – 11:00 a.m.   
Children ages 4 & under 

only! 

     Preschool Playtime is 
every Tuesday and Friday 

from 10:00 – 11:00 a.m. This 
is a special gym time for our 
littlest gymnasts (ages 4 
years and younger) and their 
parents or guardians. Bama 
Bounders instructors are on 
hand to help with skills, give 
advice and for a fun end of 
the hour activity. The cost is 
$5 per child per visit.  Bring a 
friend too! 

 

SEPTEMBER 

BIRTHDAYS! 
     Bama Bounders would like 
to wish a Happy Birthday to 
the following students with 
September birthdays: Will 
Alston, Zoey Jo Barger, 
Hannah Burrage, Gatlin 
Chichester, Aubree Clary. 
Ava Clary, Anna Dockery,  
Libby Goodwin, Anna Kate 
Hall, Izzy Hill, Raley Hoggle, 
Mary Neal Hollowell, 
Brooklyn Hudson, Colt Jones, 
Kynleigh Kemp, Thomas 
Korcz, Lydia Lailey, Levi 
Lavender, Abigal Lee, 
Jayden Lee, Erin Lewis, 
SharMari Manassa, Macee 
McKnight, Presley Miles, 
Braden Milligan, Ralynn 
Minor, Laynia Nail, Avery 
Patton, Maddie Klaire Ray, 
Ian Shen, Riley Smith, 
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George Stevens, Toby 
Tucker, Grace Wang, Lexi 
Grace Watkins, and Ava 
Loreen Watts. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

BIRTHDAY PARTIES 
We offer parties on 

Saturdays and Sundays! 
      
     Looking for a fun place to 
have a birthday party? Why 
not come to a Bama 
Bounders birthday party?!?! 

Parties are 
now offered 

on 
Saturdays 

and 
Sundays. 

Our new times for Saturdays 
are 10:00 a.m., 12 noon, 2:00 
p.m. and 4:00 p.m. Sunday 
party times are 3:00 p.m. and 
5:00 p.m.  
     The party starts with one 
hour of gymnastics with 
Bama Bounders instructors 
followed by 30 minutes of 
party time for you for cake 
and presents. The birthday 
child receives a t-shirt and all 
children receive a goodie 
bag. Parties start at $115. For 
the safety of everyone, we 
have a maximum of 25 
children per party. Be sure to 
check out all the different 
options to find the one that fits 
you best! A $50 non-
refundable deposit is due at 
the time the party is booked. 

     Book your Bama 
Bounders birthday party 
today! 

 

FIELD TRIPS 
     We offer field trips at Bama 
Bounders! Bring your 
daycare, preschool, church 
group, girl or boy scout troop, 
play group or any other group 
that might be interested in a 
field trip.  
     The field trip is one hour of 
gymnastics and games for 
only $5 per student. Field 
trips can be held in the 
mornings or early afternoons, 
as well as Saturdays. Check 
with the office for more 
information or to book your 
group's field trip today! 
 

DO YOU FOLLOW US ON 

SOCIAL MEDIA? 

     Be sure to follow Bama 
Bounders on Facebook, 
Instagram and Twitter to see 
what’s going on at Bama 
Bounders! 

 
 

BAMA BOUNDERS 

OFFSITE PROGRAMS  
         Bama Bounders not 
only offers great gymnastics 
classes in our gym, but we 
can come to your school or 
daycare as well! We will be in 
several different schools this 
fall. If your school or daycare 
is interested in Bama 

Bounders being a part of their 
aftercare program, give us a 
call!! 

 

FREE WI-FI AT  

BAMA BOUNDERS! 

     Do you need to get some 
work done while your child is 
in class or want to catch up on 
the latest news or sports? 
Now you can take advantage 
of free Wi-Fi from Bama 
Bounders! Bring your laptop 
or web enabled phone or 
table to the gym and surf 
away! SSID: BounderPublic 
and password: 2057222436 

Enjoy!!!! 
 

 

UPCOMING EVENTS 
September 1st    

Labor Day Camp 
8:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

No Classes! 
 

September 5th  
Make up day for Labor Day 

Classes at regular class time 
 

September 12th 
Parent’s Night Out 

“Fall & Football Fun” 
6:00 – 10:00 p.m. 

 

September 26th  
September Make Up Day 

5:30 – 6:30 p.m.  
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